SN TarGarw®

Old

New

[Income escaping assessment.

4 147. If the ° [Assessing] Officer °[has reason to believe’]
that any income chargeable to tax has escaped
assessment’ for any assessment year, he ‘may, subject to
the provisions of sections 148 to 153, assess or reassess’
such’ income ‘and also any other income chargeable to tax
which has escaped assessment and which comes to his
notice subsequently in the course of the proceedings’
under this section, or recompute the loss or the
depreciation allowance or any other allowance, as the case
may be, for the assessment year concerned (hereafter in
this section and in sections 148 to 153 referred to as the
relevant assessment year) :

Provided that where an assessment under sub-section (3)
of section 143 or this section has been made for the
relevant assessment year, no action shall be taken under
this section after the expiry of four years from the end of the
relevant assessment year®, unless any income chargeable
to tax has escaped assessment for such assessment year
by reason of the failure® on the part of the assessee to
make a return under section 139 or in response to a notice
issued under sub-section (1) of section 142 or section 148
or to disclose fully and truly all material facts® necessary for
his assessment, for that assessment year:

IProvided further that nothing contained in the first
proviso shall apply in a case where any income in relation

Income escaping assessment.

147. If any income chargeable to tax, in the case of an
assessee, has escaped assessment for any assessment
year, the Assessing Officer may, subject to the provisions
of sections 148 to 153, assess or reassess such income
or recompute the loss or the depreciation allowance or
any other allowance or deduction for such assessment
year (hereafter in this section and in sections 148 to 153
referred to as the relevant assessment year).

Explanation.—For the purpose of assessment or
reassessment or recomputation under this section, the
Assessing Officer may assess or reassess the income in
respect of any issue, which has escaped assessment,
and such issue comes to his notice subsequently in the
course of the proceedings under this section, irrespective
of the fact that the provisions of section 148A have not
been complied with.]




to any asset (including financial interest in any entity)
located outside India, chargeable to tax, has escaped
assessment for any assessment year:]

OrProvided * [also] that the Assessing Officer may assess
or reassess such income, other than the income involving
matters which are the subject matters of any appeal,
reference or revision, which is chargeable to tax and has
escaped assessment.]

Explanation 1.—Production*? before the Assessing Officer
of account books or other evidence from which material
evidence could with due diligence have been discovered by
the Assessing Officer will not necessarily’* amount to
disclosure within the meaning of the foregoing proviso.

Explanation 2.—For the purposes of this section, the
following shall also be deemed to be cases where income
chargeable to tax has escaped assessment, namely :—

(@) where no return of income has been furnished by
the assessee although his total income or the total income
of any other person in respect of which he is assessable
under this Act during the previous year exceeded the
maximum amount which is not chargeable to income-tax ;

(b) where a return of income has been furnished by
the assessee but no assessment has been made and it is
noticed by the Assessing Officer that the assessee has
understated the income or has claimed excessive loss,
deduction, allowance or relief in the return ;

¥[(ba) where the assessee has failed to furnish a report




in respect of any international transaction which he was so
required under section 92E;]

(© where an assessment has been made, but—

0] income chargeable to tax has been under
assessed ; or

(i) such income has been assessed at too low a rate**
; or
(i) such income has been made the subject of

excessive relief under this Act ; or

(iv) excessive loss or depreciation allowance or any
other allowance under this Act has been computed;]

®[(ca) where a return of income has not been furnished
by the assessee or a return of income has been furnished
by him and on the basis of information or document
received from the prescribed income-tax authority, under
sub-section (2) of section 133C, it is noticed by the
Assessing Officer that the income of the assessee exceeds
the maximum amount not chargeable to tax, or as the case
may be, the assessee has understated the income or has
claimed excessive loss, deduction, allowance or relief in the
return;]

181(d) where a person is found to have any asset
(including financial interest in any entity) located outside
India.]




[Explanation 3.—For the purpose of assessment or
reassessment™’® under this section, the Assessing Officer
may assess or reassess the income in respect of any issue,
which has escaped assessment, and such issue comes to
his notice subsequently in the course of the proceedings
under this section, notwithstanding that the reasons for
such issue have not been included in the reasons recorded
under sub-section (2) of section 148.]

®[Explanation 4.—For the removal of doubts, it is hereby
clarified that the provisions of this section, as amended by
the Finance Act, 2012, shall also be applicable for any
assessment year beginning on or before the 1st day of April,
2012.]

¥llssue of notice where income has escaped
assessment.
19 148. % 2[1)] Before making the assessment,

reassessment or recomputation under section 147, the
Assessing Officer shall serve® on the assessee a notice
requiring him to furnish within such period, [* * *| as may
be specified in the notice, a return of his income or the
income of any other person in respect of which he is
assessable under this Act during the previous year
corresponding to the relevant assessment year, in the
prescribed form and verified in the prescribed manner and
setting forth such other particulars as may be prescribed;
and the provisions of this Act shall, so far as may be?,
apply accordingly as if such return were a return required to
be furnished under section 139 :]

Issue of notice where income has

assessment.

escaped

148. Before making the assessment, reassessment or
recomputation under section 147, and subject to the
provisions of section 148A, the Assessing Officer shall
serve on the assessee a notice, along with a copy of the
order passed, if required, under clause (d) of section
148A, requiring him to furnish within such period, as may
be specified in such notice, a return of his income or the
income of any other person in respect of which he is
assessable under this Act during the previous year
corresponding to the relevant assessment year, in the
prescribed form and verified in the prescribed manner
and setting forth such other particulars as may be
prescribed; and the provisions of this Act shall, so far as




“[Provided that in a case—

(@) where areturn has been furnished during the period
commencing on the 1st day of October, 1991 and ending
on the 30th day of September, 2005 in response to a notice
served under this section, and

(b) subsequently a notice has been served under sub-
section (2) of section 143 after the expiry of twelve months
specified in the proviso to sub-section (2) of section 143, as
it stood immediately before the amendment of said sub-
section by the Finance Act, 2002 (20 of 2002) but before
the expiry of the time limit for making the assessment, re-
assessment or recomputation as specified in sub-section
(2) of section 153, every such notice referred to in this
clause shall be deemed to be a valid notice:

Provided further that in a case—

(@) where areturn has been furnished during the period
commencing on the 1st day of October, 1991 and ending
on the 30th day of September, 2005, in response to a
notice served under this section, and

(b)  subsequently a notice has been served under clause
(ii) of sub-section (2) of section 143 after the expiry of
twelve months specified in the proviso to clause (ii) of sub-
section (2) of section 143, but before the expiry of the time
limit for making the assessment, reassessment or

may be, apply accordingly as if such return were a return
required to be furnished under section 139:

Provided that no notice under this section shall be issued
unless there is information with the Assessing Officer
which suggests that the income chargeable to tax has
escaped assessment in the case of the assessee for the
relevant assessment year and the Assessing Officer has
obtained prior approval of the specified authority to issue
such notice.

Explanation 1.—For the purposes of this section and
section 148A, the information with the Assessing Officer
which suggests that the income chargeable to tax has
escaped assessment means,—

0] any information flagged in the case of the
assessee for the relevant assessment year in accordance
with the risk management strategy formulated by the
Board from time to time;

(i)  any final objection raised by the Comptroller and
Auditor General of India to the effect that the assessment
in the case of the assessee for the relevant assessment
year has not been made in accordance with the
provisions of this Act.

Explanation 2.—For
where,—

the purposes of this section,

0] a search is initiated under section 132 or books of
account, other documents or any assets are requisitioned
under section 132A, on or after the 1st day of April, 2021,




recomputation as specified in sub-section (2) of section
153, every such notice referred to in this clause shall be
deemed to be a valid notice.]

?[Explanation.—For the removal of doubts, it is hereby
declared that nothing contained in the first proviso or the
second proviso shall apply to any return which has been
furnished on or after the 1st day of October, 2005 in
response to a notice served under this section.]

2’[(2) The Assessing Officer shall, before issuing any notice
under this section, record his reasons for doing so.]

in the case of the assessee; or

(i) a survey is conducted under section 133A, other
than under sub-section (2A) or sub-section (5) of that
section, on or after the 1st day of April, 2021, in the case
of the assessee; or

(i) the Assessing Officer is satisfied, with the prior
approval of the Principal Commissioner or Commissionetr,
that any money, bullion, jewellery or other valuable article
or thing, seized or requisitioned under section 132 or
section 132A in case of any other person on or after the
1st day of April, 2021, belongs to the assessee; or

(iv) the Assessing Officer is satisfied, with the prior
approval of Principal Commissioner or Commissioner,
that any books of account or documents, seized or
requisitioned under section 132 or section 132A in case
of any other person on or after the 1st day of April, 2021,
pertains or pertain to, or any information contained
therein, relate to, the assessee,

the Assessing Officer shall be deemed to have
information which suggests that the income chargeable to
tax has escaped assessment in the case of the assessee
for the three assessment years immediately preceding
the assessment year relevant to the previous year in
which the search is initiated or books of account, other
documents or any assets are requisitioned or survey is
conducted in the case of the assessee or money, bullion,




jewellery or other valuable article or thing or books of
account or documents are seized or requisitioned in case
of any other person.

Explanation 3.—For the purposes of this section,
specified authority means the specified authority referred
to in section 151.]

2’ [Conducting inquiry, providing opportunity before
issue of notice under section 148.

148A. The Assessing Officer shall, before issuing any
notice under section 148,—

@) conduct any enquiry, if required, with the prior
approval of specified authority, with respect to the
information which suggests that the income chargeable to
tax has escaped assessment;

(b) provide an opportunity of being heard to the
assessee, with the prior approval of specified authority,
by serving upon him a notice to show cause within such
time, as may be specified in the notice, being not less
than seven days and but not exceeding thirty days from
the date on which such notice is issued, or such time, as
may be extended by him on the basis of an application in
this behalf, as to why a notice under section 148 should
not be issued on the basis of information which suggests
that income chargeable to tax has escaped assessment
in his case for the relevant assessment year and results
of enquiry conducted, if any, as per clause (a);




(© consider the reply of assessee furnished, if any, in
response to the show-cause notice referred to in clause

(b);

(d) decide, on the basis of material available on
record including reply of the assessee, whether or not it is
a fit case to issue a notice under section 148, by passing
an order, with the prior approval of specified authority,
within one month from the end of the month in which the
reply referred to in clause (c) is received by him, or where
no such reply is furnished, within one month from the end
of the month in which time or extended time allowed to
furnish a reply as per clause (b) expires:

Provided that the provisions of this section shall not
apply in a case where,—

(@) a search is initiated under section 132 or books of
account, other documents or any assets are requisitioned
under section 132A in the case of the assessee on or
after the 1st day of April, 2021; or

(b) the Assessing Officer is satisfied, with the prior
approval of the Principal Commissioner or Commissioner
that any money, bullion, jewellery or other valuable article
or thing, seized in a search under section 132 or
requisitioned under section 132A, in the case of any other
person on or after the 1st day of April, 2021, belongs to
the assessee; or

(© the Assessing Officer is satisfied, with the prior




approval of the Principal Commissioner or Commissioner
that any books of account or documents, seized in a
search under section 132 or requisitioned under section
132A, in case of any other person on or after the 1st day
of April, 2021, pertains or pertain to, or any information
contained therein, relate to, the assessee.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this section, specified
authority means the specified authority referred to in
section 151.]

Time limit for notice.

28 149. #[(1) No notice under section 148 shall be issued*®
for the relevant assessment year,—

31[(a) if four years have elapsed from the end of the relevant
assessment year, unless the case falls under clause (b)
%[or clause (c)];

(b) if four years, but not more than six years, have elapsed
from the end of the relevant assessment year unless the
income chargeable to tax which has **escaped assessment
amounts to or is likely to amount to one lakh rupees or
more>? for that year;]

#[(c) if four years, but not more than sixteen years, have
elapsed from the end of the relevant assessment year
unless the income in relation to any asset (including
financial interest in any entity) located outside India,
chargeable to tax, has escaped assessment.]

Explanation.—In determining income chargeable to tax

Time limit for notice.

149. (1) No notice under section 148 shall be issued for
the relevant assessment year,—

(@) if three years have elapsed from the end of the
relevant assessment year, unless the case falls under
clause (b);

(b) if three years, but not more than ten years, have
elapsed from the end of the relevant assessment year
unless the Assessing Officer has in his possession books
of accounts or other documents or evidence which reveal
that the income chargeable to tax, represented in the
form of asset, which has escaped assessment amounts
to or is likely to amount to fifty lakh rupees or more for
that year:

Provided that no notice under section 148 shall be
issued at any time in a case for the relevant assessment




which has escaped assessment for the purposes of this
sub-section, the provisions of Explanation 2 of section 147
shall apply as they apply for the purposes of that section.]

(2) The provisions of sub-section (1) as to the issue of
notice shall be subject to the provisions of section 151.

(3) If the person on whom a notice under section 148 is to
be served is a person treated as the agent of a non-resident
under section 163 and the assessment, reassessment or
recomputation to be made in pursuance of the notice is to
be made on him as the agent of such non-resident, the
notice shall not be issued after the expiry of a period of
%[six] years from the end of the relevant assessment year.

%[Explanation.—For the removal of doubts, it is hereby
clarified that the provisions of sub-sections (1) and (3), as
amended by the Finance Act, 2012, shall also be applicable
for any assessment year beginning on or before the 1st day
of April, 2012.]

year beginning on or before 1st day of April, 2021, if such
notice could not have been issued at that time on account
of being beyond the time limit specified under the
provisions of clause (b) of sub-section (1) of this section,
as they stood immediately before the commencement of
the Finance Act, 2021.:

Provided further that the provisions of this sub-section
shall not apply in a case, where a notice under section
153A, or section 153C read with section 153A, is required
to be issued in relation to a search initiated under section
132 or books of account, other documents or any assets
requisitioned under section 132A, on or before the 31st
day of March, 2021:

Provided also that for the purposes of computing the
period of limitation as per this section, the time or
extended time allowed to the assessee, as per show-
cause notice issued under clause (b) of section 148A or
the period during which the proceeding under section
148A is stayed by an order or injunction of any court,
shall be excluded:

Provided also that where immediately after the exclusion
of the period referred to in the immediately preceding
proviso, the period of limitation available to the Assessing
Officer for passing an order under clause (d) of section
148A is less than seven days, such remaining period
shall be extended to seven days and the period of
limitation under this sub-section shall be deemed to be
extended accordingly.




Explanation.—For the purposes of clause (b) of this sub-
section, "asset" shall include immovable property, being
land or building or both, shares and securities, loans and
advances, deposits in bank account.

(2) The provisions of sub-section (1) as to the issue of
notice shall be subject to the provisions of section 151.

Provision for cases where assessment is in pursuance
of an order on appeal, etc.

37 150. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in section
149, the notice under section 148 may be issued at any
time for the purpose of making an assessment or
reassessment or recomputation in consequence of or to
give effect to *any finding or direction contained in an order
passed by any authority in any proceeding under this Act by
way of appeal, reference or revision **[or by a Court in any
proceeding under any other law].

(2) The provisions of sub-section (1) shall not apply in any
case where any such assessment, reassessment or
recomputation as is referred to in that sub-section relates to
an assessment year in respect of which an assessment,
reassessment or recomputation could not have been made
at the time the order which was the subject-matter of the
appeal, reference or revision, as the case may be, was
made by reason of any other provision limiting the time
within which any action for assessment, reassessment or
recomputation may be taken.

Provision for cases where assessment is in
pursuance of an order on appeal, etc.

37150. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in section
149, the notice under section 148 may be issued at any
time for the purpose of making an assessment or
reassessment or recomputation in consequence of or to
give effect to *any finding or direction contained in an
order passed by any authority in any proceeding under
this Act by way of appeal, reference or revision *[or by a
Court in any proceeding under any other law].

(2) The provisions of sub-section (1) shall not apply in
any case where any such assessment, reassessment or
recomputation as is referred to in that sub-section relates
to an assessment year in respect of which an
assessment, reassessment or recomputation could not
have been made at the time the order which was the
subject-matter of the appeal, reference or revision, as the
case may be, was made by reason of any other provision
limiting the time within which any action for assessment,




reassessment or recomputation may be taken.

“0[sanction for issue of notice.

“1 151. (1) No notice shall be issued under section 148 by
an Assessing Officer, after the expiry of a period of four
years from the end of the relevant assessment year, unless
the Principal Chief Commissioner or Chief Commissioner or
Principal Commissioner or Commissioner is satisfied, on
the reasons recorded by the Assessing Officer, that it is a fit
case for the issue of such notice.

(2) In a case other than a case falling under sub-section (1),
no notice shall be issued under section 148 by an
Assessing Officer, who is below the rank of Joint
Commissioner, unless the Joint Commissioner is satisfied,
on the reasons recorded by such Assessing Officer, that it
is a fit case for the issue of such notice.

(3) For the purposes of sub-section (1) and sub-section (2),
the Principal Chief Commissioner or the Chief
Commissioner or the Principal Commissioner or the
Commissioner or the Joint Commissioner, as the case may
be, being satisfied on the reasons recorded by the
Assessing Officer about fitness of a case for the issue of
notice under section 148, need not issue such notice
himself.]

4041 1sanction for issue of notice.

151. Specified authority for the purposes of section 148
and section 148A shall be,—

0] Principal Commissioner or Principal Director or
Commissioner or Director, if three years or less than
three years have elapsed from the end of the relevant
assessment year;

(i) Principal Chief Commissioner or Principal Director
General or where there is no Principal Chief
Commissioner or Principal Director General, Chief
Commissioner or Director General, if more than three
years have elapsed from the end of the relevant
assessment year. |

Other provisions.
152. (1) In an assessment, reassessment or recomputation

Other provisions.




made under section 147, the tax shall be chargeable at the
rate or rates at which it would have been charged had the
income not escaped assessment.

(2) Where an assessment is reopened *’[under section
147], the assessee may, if he has not impugned any part of
the original assessment order for that year either under
sections 246 to 248 or under section 264, claim that the
proceedings under section 147 shall be dropped on his
showing that he had been assessed on an amount or to a
sum not lower than what he would be rightly liable for even
if the income alleged to have escaped assessment had
been taken into account, or the assessment or computation
had been properly made :

Provided that in so doing he shall not be entitled to reopen
matters concluded by an order under section 154, 155, 260,
262, or 263.

152. (1) In an assessment, reassessment or
recomputation made under section 147, the tax shall be
chargeable at the rate or rates at which it would have
been charged had the income not escaped assessment.

(2) Where an assessment is reopened **[under section
147], the assessee may, if he has not impugned any part
of the original assessment order for that year either under
sections 246 to 248 or under section 264, claim that the
proceedings under section 147 shall be dropped on his
showing that he had been assessed on an amount or to a
sum not lower than what he would be rightly liable for
even if the income alleged to have escaped assessment
had been taken into account, or the assessment or
computation had been properly made :

Provided that in so doing he shall not be entitled to
reopen matters concluded by an order under section 154,
155, 260, 262, or 263.

“[Time limit for completion of assessment,
reassessment and recomputation.

44 153. (1) No order of assessment® shall be made under
section 143 or section 144 at any time after the expiry of
twenty-one months from the end of the assessment year in
which the income was first assessable:

“[Provided that in respect of an order of assessment
relating to the assessment year commencing on the 1st day
of April, 2018, the provisions of this sub-section shall have
effect, as if for the words "twenty-one months", the words

“ITime limit for completion of assessment,
reassessment and recomputation.

4 153. (1) No order of assessment* shall be made
under section 143 or section 144 at any time after the
expiry of twenty-one months from the end of the
assessment year in which the income was first
assessable:

“IProvided that in respect of an order of assessment




"eighteen months" had been substituted:

Provided further that in respect of an order of assessment
relating to the assessment year commencing on or after the
1st day of April, 2019, the provisions of this sub-section
shall have effect, as if for the words "twenty-one months",
the words "twelve months" had been substituted.]

(2) No order of assessment, reassessment or
recomputation shall be made under section 147 after the
expiry of nine months from the end of the financial year in
which the notice under section 148 was served:

“*[Provided that where the notice under section 148 is
served on or after the 1st day of April, 2019, the provisions
of this sub-section shall have effect, as if for the words "nine
months”, the words "twelve months" had been substituted.]

(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections (1)
and (2), an order of fresh assessment in pursuance of an
order under section 254 or section 263 or section 264,
setting aside or cancelling an assessment, may be made at
any time before the expiry of nine months from the end of
the financial year in which the order under section 254 is
received by the Principal Chief Commissioner or Chief
Commissioner or Principal Commissioner or Commissioner
or, as the case may be, the order under section 263 or
section 264 is passed by the Principal Commissioner or
Commissioner:

“®IProvided that where the order under section 254 is
received by the Principal Chief Commissioner or Chief
Commissioner or Principal Commissioner or Commissioner

relating to the assessment year commencing on the 1st
day of April, 2018, the provisions of this sub-section shall
have effect, as if for the words "twenty-one months", the
words "eighteen months" had been substituted:

Provided further that in respect of an order of
assessment relating to the assessment year commencing
on or after the 1st day of April, 2019, the provisions of this
sub-section shall have effect, as if for the words "twenty-
one months", the words "twelve months" had been

substituted:]

472 IProvided also that in respect of an order of

assessment relating to the assessment year commencing
on or after the 1st day of April, 2021, the provisions of this
sub-section shall have effect, as if for the words "twenty-
one months", the words "nine months" had been
substituted. |

(2) No order of assessment, reassessment or
recomputation shall be made under section 147 after the
expiry of nine months from the end of the financial year in
which the notice under section 148 was served:

“IProvided that where the notice under section 148 is
served on or after the 1st day of April, 2019, the
provisions of this sub-section shall have effect, as if for
the words "nine months", the words "twelve months" had
been substituted.]

(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections
(1) and (2), an order of fresh assessment in pursuance of
an order under section 254 or section 263 or section 264,




or, as the case may be, the order under section 263 or
section 264 is passed by the Principal Commissioner or
Commissioner on or after the 1st day of April, 2019, the
provisions of this sub-section shall have effect, as if for the
words "nine months", the words "twelve months" had been
substituted.]

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections (1),
(2) and (3), where a reference under sub-section (1) of
section 92CA is made during the course of the proceeding
for the assessment or reassessment, the period available
for completion of assessment or reassessment, as the case
may be, under the said sub-sections (1), (2) and (3) shall be
extended by twelve months.

(5) Where effect to an order under section 250 or section
254 or section 260 or section 262 or section 263 or section
264 is to be given by the Assessing Officer, wholly or partly,
otherwise than by making a fresh assessment or
reassessment, such effect shall be given within a period of
three months from the end of the month in which order
under section 250 or section 254 or section 260 or section
262 is received by the Principal Chief Commissioner or
Chief Commissioner or Principal Commissioner or
Commissioner, as the case may be, the order under section
263 or section 264 is passed by the Principal Commissioner
or Commissioner:

Provided that where it is not possible for the Assessing
Officer to give effect to such order within the aforesaid
period, for reasons beyond his control, the Principal

setting aside or cancelling an assessment, may be made
at any time before the expiry of nine months from the end
of the financial year in which the order under section 254
Is received by the Principal Chief Commissioner or Chief
Commissioner  or Principal Commissioner or
Commissioner or, as the case may be, the order under
section 263 or section 264 is passed by the Principal

Commissioner or Commissioner:

“™PIprovided that where the order under section 254 is

received by the Principal Chief Commissioner or Chief
Commissioner  or Principal Commissioner  or
Commissioner or, as the case may be, the order under
section 263 or section 264 is passed by the Principal
Commissioner or Commissioner on or after the 1st day of
April, 2019, the provisions of this sub-section shall have
effect, as if for the words "nine months", the words
"twelve months" had been substituted.]

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections
(1), (2) and (3), where a reference under sub-section (1)
of section 92CA is made during the course of the
proceeding for the assessment or reassessment, the
period available for completion of assessment or
reassessment, as the case may be, under the said sub-
sections (1), (2) and (3) shall be extended by twelve
months.

(5) Where effect to an order under section 250 or section
254 or section 260 or section 262 or section 263 or
section 264 is to be given by the Assessing Officer,




Commissioner or Commissioner on receipt of such request
in writing from the Assessing Officer, if satisfied, may allow
an additional period of six months to give effect to the order:

“’IProvided further that where an order under section 250
or section 254 or section 260 or section 262 or section 263
or section 264 requires verification of any issue by way of
submission of any document by the assessee or any other
person or where an opportunity of being heard is to be
provided to the assessee, the order giving effect to the said
order under section 250 or section 254 or section 260 or
section 262 or section 263 or section 264 shall be made
within the time specified in sub-section (3).]

(6) Nothing contained in sub-sections (1) and (2) shall apply
to the following classes of assessments, reassessments
and recomputation which may, subject to the provisions of
sub-sections (3) and (5), be completed—

0] where the assessment, reassessment or
recomputation is made on the assessee or any person in
consequence of or to give effect to any finding or direction*®
contained in an order under section 250, section 254,
section 260, section 262, section 263, or section 264 or in
an order of any court in a proceeding otherwise than by way
of appeal or reference under this Act, on or before the
expiry of twelve months from the end of the month in which
such order is received or passed by the Principal
Commissioner or Commissioner, as the case may be; or

(i) where, in the case of a firm, an assessment is made
on a partner of the firm in consequence of an assessment

wholly or partly, otherwise than by making a fresh
assessment or reassessment, such effect shall be given
within a period of three months from the end of the month
in which order under section 250 or section 254 or
section 260 or section 262 is received by the Principal
Chief Commissioner or Chief Commissioner or Principal
Commissioner or Commissioner, as the case may be, the
order under section 263 or section 264 is passed by the
Principal Commissioner or Commissioner:

Provided that where it is not possible for the Assessing
Officer to give effect to such order within the aforesaid
period, for reasons beyond his control, the Principal
Commissioner or Commissioner on receipt of such
request in writing from the Assessing Officer, if satisfied,
may allow an additional period of six months to give effect
to the order:

“8[Provided further that where an order under section
250 or section 254 or section 260 or section 262 or
section 263 or section 264 requires verification of any
issue by way of submission of any document by the
assessee or any other person or where an opportunity of
being heard is to be provided to the assessee, the order
giving effect to the said order under section 250 or
section 254 or section 260 or section 262 or section 263
or section 264 shall be made within the time specified in
sub-section (3).]

(6) Nothing contained in sub-sections (1) and (2) shall
apply to the following classes of assessments,




made on the firm under section 147, on or before the expiry
of twelve months from the end of the month in which the
assessment order in the case of the firm is passed.

(7) Where effect to any order, finding or direction referred to
in sub-section (5) or sub-section (6) is to be given by the
Assessing Officer, within the time specified in the said sub-
sections, and such order has been received or passed, as
the case may be, by the income-tax authority specified
therein before the 1st day of June, 2016, the Assessing
Officer shall give effect to such order, finding or direction, or
assess, reassess or recompute the income of the
assessee, on or before the 31st day of March, 2017.

(8) Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing
provisions of this section, sub-section (2) of section 153A or
sub-section (1) of section 153B, the order of assessment or
reassessment, relating to any assessment year, which
stands revived under sub-section (2) of section 153A, shall
be made within a period of one year from the end of the
month of such revival or within the period specified in this
section or sub-section (1) of section 153B, whichever is
later.

(9) The provisions of this section as they stood immediately
before the commencement of the Finance Act, 2016, shall
apply to and in relation to any order of assessment,
reassessment or recomputation made before the 1st day of
June, 2016:

“8aprovided that where a notice under sub-section (1) of
section 142 or sub- section (2) of section 143 or section 148

reassessments and recomputation which may, subject to
the provisions of sub-sections (3) and (5), be
completed—

0] where the assessment, reassessment or
recomputation is made on the assessee or any person in
consequence of or to give effect to any finding or
direction®® contained in an order under section 250,
section 254, section 260, section 262, section 263, or
section 264 or in an order of any court in a proceeding
otherwise than by way of appeal or reference under this
Act, on or before the expiry of twelve months from the
end of the month in which such order is received or
passed by the Principal Commissioner or Commissioner,
as the case may be; or

(i) where, in the case of a firm, an assessment is
made on a partner of the firm in consequence of an
assessment made on the firm under section 147, on or
before the expiry of twelve months from the end of the
month in which the assessment order in the case of the
firm is passed.

(7) Where effect to any order, finding or direction referred
to in sub-section (5) or sub-section (6) is to be given by
the Assessing Officer, within the time specified in the said
sub-sections, and such order has been received or
passed, as the case may be, by the income-tax authority
specified therein before the 1st day of June, 2016, the
Assessing Officer shall give effect to such order, finding




has been issued prior to the 1st day of June, 2016 and the
assessment or reassessment has not been completed by
such date due to exclusion of time referred to in
Explanation 1, such assessment or reassessment shall be
completed in accordance with the provisions of this section
as it stood immediately before its substitution by the
Finance Act, 2016 (28 of 2016).]

Explanation 1.—For the purposes of this section, in
computing the period of limitation—

0] the time taken in reopening the whole or any part of
the proceeding or in giving an opportunity to the assessee
to be re- heard under the proviso to section 129; or

(i) the period during which the assessment
proceeding® is stayed by an order or injunction of any
court; or

(i) the period commencing from the date on which the
Assessing Officer intimates the Central Government or the
prescribed authority, the contravention of the provisions of
clause (21) or clause (22B) or clause (23A) or clause (23B)
or sub-clause (iv) or sub-clause (v) or sub-clause (vi) or
sub-clause (via) of clause (23C) of section 10, under clause
(i) of the proviso to sub-section (3) of section 143 and
ending with the date on which the copy of the order
withdrawing the approval or rescinding the notification, as
the case may be, under those clauses is received by the
Assessing Officer; or

(iv) the period commencing from the date on which the

or direction, or assess, reassess or recompute the
income of the assessee, on or before the 31st day of
March, 2017.

(8) Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing
provisions of this section, sub-section (2) of section 153A
or sub-section (1) of section 153B, the order of
assessment or reassessment, relating to any assessment
year, which stands revived under sub-section (2) of
section 153A, shall be made within a period of one year
from the end of the month of such revival or within the
period specified in this section or sub-section (1) of
section 153B, whichever is later.

(9) The provisions of this section as they stood
immediately before the commencement of the Finance
Act, 2016, shall apply to and in relation to any order of
assessment, reassessment or recomputation made
before the 1st day of June, 2016:

*[Provided that where a notice under sub-section (1) of
section 142 or sub-section (2) of section 143 or section
148 has been issued prior to the 1st day of June, 2016
and the assessment or reassessment has not been
completed by such date due to exclusion of time referred
to in Explanation 1, such assessment or reassessment
shall be completed in accordance with the provisions of
this section as it stood immediately before its substitution
by the Finance Act, 2016 (28 of 2016).]

Explanation 1. —For the purposes of this section, in
computing the period of limitation—




Assessing Officer directs the assessee to get his accounts
audited under sub-section (2A) of section 142 and—

(@) ending with the last date on which the assessee is
required to furnish a report of such audit under that sub-
section; or

(b) where such direction is challenged before a court,
ending with the date on which the order setting aside such
direction is received by the Principal Commissioner or
Commissioner; or

(v) the period commencing from the date on which the
Assessing Officer makes a reference to the Valuation
Officer under sub- section (1) of section 142A and ending
with the date on which the report of the Valuation Officer is
received by the Assessing Officer; or

(vi) the period (not exceeding sixty days) commencing
from the date on which the Assessing Officer received the
declaration under sub-section (1) of section 158A and
ending with the date on which the order under sub-section
(3) of that section is made by him; or

(vii) in a case where an application made before the
Income-tax Settlement Commission is rejected by it or is
not allowed to be proceeded with by it, the period
commencing from the date on which an application is made
before the Settlement Commission under section 245C and
ending with the date on which the order under sub-section
(1) of section 245D is received by the Principal

(1) the time taken in reopening the whole or any part
of the proceeding or in giving an opportunity to the

assessee to be re-heard under the proviso to section 129;

or

(i) the period during which the assessment
proceeding® is stayed by an order or injunction of any
court; or

(i) the period commencing from the date on which
the Assessing Officer intimates the Central Government
or the prescribed authority, the contravention of the
provisions of clause (21) or clause (22B) or clause (23A)
or clause (23B) or sub-clause (iv) or sub-clause (v) or
sub-clause (vi) or sub-clause (via) of clause (23C) of
section 10, under clause (i) of the proviso to sub-section
(3) of section 143 and ending with the date on which the
copy of the order withdrawing the approval or rescinding
the notification, as the case may be, under those clauses
is received by the Assessing Officer; or

(iv) the period commencing from the date on which
the Assessing Officer directs the assessee to get his
accounts audited under sub-section (2A) of section 142
and—

(@) ending with the last date on which the assessee
is required to furnish a report of such audit under that
sub-section; or

(b)

where such direction is challenged before a court,




Commissioner or Commissioner under sub-section (2) of
that section; or

(viii)  the period commencing from the date on which an
application is made before the Authority for Advance
Rulings under sub-section (1) of section 245Q and ending
with the date on which the order rejecting the application is
received by the Principal Commissioner or Commissioner
under sub-section (3) of section 245R; or

(iX) the period commencing from the date on which an
application is made before the Authority for Advance
Rulings under sub- section (1) of section 245Q and ending
with the date on which the advance ruling pronounced by it
is received by the Principal Commissioner or Commissioner
under sub-section (7) of section 245R; or

(x) the period commencing from the date on which a
reference or first of the references for exchange of
information is made by an authority competent under an
agreement referred to in section 90 or section 90A and
ending with the date on which the information requested is
last received by the Principal Commissioner or
Commissioner or a period of one year, whichever is less; or

(xi) the period commencing from the date on which a
reference for declaration of an arrangement to be an
impermissible avoidance arrangement is received by the
Principal Commissioner or Commissioner under sub-
section (1) of section 144BA and ending on the date on

ending with the date on which the order setting aside
such direction is received by the Principal Commissioner
or Commissioner; or

(v) the period commencing from the date on which
the Assessing Officer makes a reference to the Valuation
Officer under sub-section (1) of section 142A and ending
with the date on which the report of the Valuation Officer
is received by the Assessing Officer; or

(vi) the period (not exceeding sixty days)
commencing from the date on which the Assessing
Officer received the declaration under sub-section (1) of
section 158A and ending with the date on which the order
under sub-section (3) of that section is made by him; or

(vii) in a case where an application made before the
Income-tax Settlement Commission is rejected by it or is
not allowed to be proceeded with by it, the period
commencing from the date on which an application is
made before the Settlement Commission under section
245C and ending with the date on which the order under
sub-section (1) of section 245D is received by the
Principal Commissioner or Commissioner under sub-
section (2) of that section; or

(viii)  the period commencing from the date on which
an application is made before the Authority for Advance
Rulings >**[or before the Board for Advance Rulings]
under sub-section (1) of section 245Q and ending with




which a direction under sub-section (3) or sub-section (6) or
an order under sub-section (5) of the said section is
received by the Assessing Officer,

shall be excluded:

Provided that where immediately after the exclusion of the
aforesaid period, the period of limitation referred to in sub-
sections (1), (2), (3) and sub-section (8) available to the
Assessing Officer for making an order of assessment,
reassessment or recomputation, as the case may be, is
less than sixty days, such remaining period shall be
extended to sixty days and the aforesaid period of limitation
shall be deemed to be extended accordingly:

Provided further that where the period available to the
Transfer Pricing Officer is extended to sixty days in
accordance with the proviso to sub-section (3A) of section
92CA and the period of limitation available to the Assessing
Officer for making an order of assessment, reassessment
or recomputation, as the case may be, is less than sixty
days, such remaining period shall be extended to sixty days
and the aforesaid period of limitation shall be deemed to be
extended accordingly:

Provided also that where a proceeding before the
Settlement Commission abates under section 245HA, the
period of limitation available under this section to the
Assessing Officer for making an order of assessment,
reassessment or recomputation, as the case may be, shall,
after the exclusion of the period under sub-section (4) of
section 245HA, be not less than one year; and where such

the date on which the order rejecting the application is
received by the Principal Commissioner or Commissioner
under sub-section (3) of section 245R; or

(ix) the period commencing from the date on which
an application is made before the Authority for Advance
Rulings >**[or before the Board for Advance Rulings]
under sub-section (1) of section 245Q and ending with
the date on which the advance ruling pronounced by it is
received by the Principal Commissioner or Commissioner
under sub-section (7) of section 245R; or

(x) the period commencing from the date on which a
reference or first of the references for exchange of
information is made by an authority competent under an
agreement referred to in section 90 or section 90A and
ending with the date on which the information requested
is last received by the Principal Commissioner or
Commissioner or a period of one year, whichever is less;
or

(xi) the period commencing from the date on which a
reference for declaration of an arrangement to be an
impermissible avoidance arrangement is received by the
Principal Commissioner or Commissioner under sub-
section (1) of section 144BA and ending on the date on
which a direction under sub-section (3) or sub-section (6)
or an order under sub-section (5) of the said section is
received by the Assessing Officer,




period of limitation is less than one year, it shall be deemed
to have been extended to one year; and for the purposes of
determining the period of limitation under sections 149,
0[***] 154, 155 and 158BE and for the purposes of payment
of interest under section 244A, this proviso shall also apply
accordingly.

Explanation 2.—For the purposes of this section, where, by
an order referred to in clause (i) of sub-section (6),—

(@) any income is excluded from the total income of the
assessee for an assessment year, then, an assessment of
such income for another assessment year shall, for the
purposes of section 150 and this section, be deemed to be
one made in consequence of or to give effect to any finding
or direction contained in the said order; or

(b) any income is excluded from the total income of one
person and held to be the income of another person, then,
an assessment of such income on such other person shall,
for the purposes of section 150 and this section, be deemed
to be one made in consequence of or to give effect to any
finding or direction contained in the said order, if such other
person was given an opportunity of being heard before the
said order was passed.]

shall be excluded:

Provided that where immediately after the exclusion of
the aforesaid period, the period of limitation referred to in
sub-sections (1), (2), (3) and sub-section (8) available to
the Assessing Officer for making an order of assessment,
reassessment or recomputation, as the case may be, is
less than sixty days, such remaining period shall be
extended to sixty days and the aforesaid period of
limitation shall be deemed to be extended accordingly:

Provided further that where the period available to the
Transfer Pricing Officer is extended to sixty days in
accordance with the proviso to sub-section (3A) of
section 92CA and the period of limitation available to the
Assessing Officer for making an order of assessment,
reassessment or recomputation, as the case may be, is
less than sixty days, such remaining period shall be
extended to sixty days and the aforesaid period of
limitation shall be deemed to be extended accordingly:

Provided also that where a proceeding before the
Settlement Commission abates under section 245HA, the
period of limitation available under this section to the
Assessing Officer for making an order of assessment,
reassessment or recomputation, as the case may be,
shall, after the exclusion of the period under sub-section
(4) of section 245HA, be not less than one year; and
where such period of limitation is less than one year, it
shall be deemed to have been extended to one year; and
for the purposes of determining the period of limitation




under sections 149, >’[***] 154, 155 and 158BE and for
the purposes of payment of interest under section 244A,
this proviso shall also apply accordingly:

2 [Provided also that where the assessee exercises the
option to withdraw the application under sub-section (1)
of section 245M, the period of limitation available under
this section to the Assessing Officer for making an order
of assessment, reassessment or recomputation, as the
case may be, shall, after the exclusion of the period
under sub-section (5) of the said section, be not less than
one year; and where such period of limitation is less than
one year, it shall be deemed to have been extended to
one year:

Provided also that for the purposes of determining the
period of limitation under sections 149, 154 and 155, and
for the purposes of payment of interest under section
244A, the provisions of the fourth proviso shall apply
accordingly. ]

Explanation 2. —For the purposes of this section, where,
by an order referred to in clause (i) of sub-section (6),—

@) any income is excluded from the total income of
the assessee for an assessment year, then, an
assessment of such income for another assessment year
shall, for the purposes of section 150 and this section, be
deemed to be one made in consequence of or to give
effect to any finding or direction contained in the said
order; or

(b) any income is excluded from the total income of




one person and held to be the income of another person,
then, an assessment of such income on such other
person shall, for the purposes of section 150 and this
section, be deemed to be one made in consequence of or
to give effect to any finding or direction contained in the
said order, if such other person was given an opportunity
of being heard before the said order was passed.]

*l[Assessment in case of search or requisition.>

> 153A. **[(1)] Notwithstanding anything contained in
section 139, section 147, section 148, section 149, section
151 and section 153, in the case of a person®® where a
search is initiated under section 132 or books of account,
other documents or any assets are requisitioned under
section 132A after the 31st day of May, 2003, the
Assessing Officer shall—

(@) Issue notice to such person requiring him to furnish
within such period, as may be specified in the notice, the
return of income in respect of each assessment year falling
within six assessment years *°[and for the relevant
assessment year or years] referred to in clause (b), in the
prescribed form and verified in the prescribed manner and
setting forth such other particulars as may be prescribed
and the provisions of this Act shall, *®so far as may be,
apply accordingly as if such return were a return required to

>[Assessment in case of search or requisition.>

> 153A. *°[(1)] Notwith standing anything contained in
section 139, section 147, section 148, section 149,
section 151 and section 153, in the case of a person®’
where a search is initiated under section 132 or books of
account, other documents or any assets are requisitioned
under section 132A after the 31st day of May, 2003
>aput on or before the 31st day of March, 2021], the
Assessing Officer shall—

€)) Issue notice to such person requiring him to
furnish within such period, as may be specified in the
notice, the return of income in respect of each
assessment year falling within six assessment years
*8[and for the relevant assessment year or years] referred
to in clause (b), in the prescribed form and verified in the
prescribed manner and setting forth such other
particulars as may be prescribed and the provisions of
this Act shall, *’so far as may be, apply accordingly as if




be furnished under section 139;

(b) assess or reassess the total income of six
assessment years immediately preceding the assessment
year relevant to the previous year in which such search is
conducted or requisition is made ®[and for the relevant
assessment year or years] :

Provided that the Assessing Officer shall assess or
reassess the total income in respect of each assessment
year falling within such six assessment years “°[and for the
relevant assessment year or years] :

Provided further that assessment or reassessment, if any,
relating to any assessment year falling within the period of
six assessment years *°[and for the relevant assessment
year or years] referred to in this °’[sub-section] pending®®
on the date of initiation of the search under section 132 or
making of requisition under section 132A, as the case may
be, shall abate®® :

*[Provided also that the Central Government may by
rules®® made by it and published in the Official Gazette
(except in cases where any assessment or reassessment
has abated under the second proviso), specify the class or
classes of cases in which the Assessing Officer shall not be
required to issue notice for assessing or reassessing the
total income for six assessment years immediately
preceding the assessment year relevant to the previous
year in which search is conducted or requisition is made
®1[and for the relevant assessment year or years]:]

such return were a return required to be furnished under
section 139;

(b) assess or reassess the total income of six
assessment years immediately preceding the
assessment year relevant to the previous year in which
such search is conducted or requisition is made *®[and for
the relevant assessment year or years] :

Provided that the Assessing Officer shall assess or
reassess the total income in respect of each assessment
year falling within such six assessment years *®[and for
the relevant assessment year or years] :

Provided further that assessment or reassessment, if
any, relating to any assessment year falling within the
period of six assessment years “®[and for the relevant
assessment year or years] referred to in this *°[sub-
section] pending® on the date of initiation of the search
under section 132 or making of requisition under section
132A, as the case may be, shall abate® :

®l[Provided also that the Central Government may by
rules®® made by it and published in the Official Gazette
(except in cases where any assessment or reassessment
has abated under the second proviso), specify the class
or classes of cases in which the Assessing Officer shall
not be required to issue notice for assessing or
reassessing the total income for six assessment years
immediately preceding the assessment year relevant to
the previous year in which search is conducted or




®IProvided also that no notice for assessment or
reassessment shall be issued by the Assessing Officer for
the relevant assessment year or years unless—

(@) the Assessing Officer has in his possession books of
account or other documents or evidence which reveal that
the income, represented in the form of asset, which has
escaped assessment amounts to or is likely to amount to
fifty lakh rupees or more in the relevant assessment year or
in aggregate in the relevant assessment years;

(b) the income referred to in clause (a) or part thereof
has escaped assessment for such year or years; and

(© the search under section 132 is initiated or
requisition under section 132A is made on or after the 1st
day of April, 2017.

Explanation 1.—For the purposes of this sub-section, the
expression "relevant assessment year" shall mean an
assessment year preceding the assessment year relevant
to the previous year in which search is conducted or
requisition is made which falls beyond six assessment
years but not later than ten assessment years from the end
of the assessment year relevant to the previous year in
which search is conducted or requisition is made.

Explanation 2.—For the purposes of the fourth proviso,
"asset" shall include immovable property being land or
building or both, shares and securities, loans and
advances, deposits in bank account.]

requisition is made ®[and for the relevant assessment
year or years]:]

®[Provided also that no notice for assessment or
reassessment shall be issued by the Assessing Officer
for the relevant assessment year or years unless—

(@) the Assessing Officer has in his possession books
of account or other documents or evidence which reveal
that the income, represented in the form of asset, which
has escaped assessment amounts to or is likely to
amount to fifty lakh rupees or more in the relevant
assessment year or in aggregate in the relevant
assessment years;

(b) the income referred to in clause (a) or part thereof
has escaped assessment for such year or years; and

(© the search under section 132 is initiated or
requisition under section 132A is made on or after the 1st
day of April, 2017.

Explanation 1.—For the purposes of this sub-section, the
expression "relevant assessment year" shall mean an
assessment year preceding the assessment year relevant
to the previous year in which search is conducted or
requisition is made which falls beyond six assessment
years but not later than ten assessment years from the
end of the assessment year relevant to the previous year
in which search is conducted or requisition is made.

Explanation 2.—For the purposes of the fourth proviso,




®2[(2) If any proceeding initiated or any order of assessment
or reassessment made under sub-section (1) has been
annulled in appeal or any other legal proceeding, then,
notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1) or
section 153, the assessment or reassessment relating to
any assessment year which has abated under the second
proviso to sub-section (1), shall stand revived with effect
from the date of receipt of the order of such annulment by
the ®*[Principal Commissioner or] Commissioner:

Provided that such revival shall cease to have effect, if
such order of annulment is set aside.]

Explanation.—For the removal of doubts, it is hereby
declared that,—

0] save as otherwise provided in this section, section
153B and section 153C, all other provisions of this Act shall
apply to the assessment made under this section;

(i) In an assessment or reassessment made in respect
of an assessment year under this section, the tax shall be
chargeable at the rate or rates as applicable to such
assessment year.

"asset" shall include immovable property being land or
building or both, shares and securities, loans and
advances, deposits in bank account.]

®[(@2) If any proceeding initiated or any order of
assessment or reassessment made under sub-section (1)
has been annulled in appeal or any other legal
proceeding, then, notwithstanding anything contained in
sub-section (1) or section 153, the assessment or
reassessment relating to any assessment year which has
abated under the second proviso to sub-section (1), shall
stand revived with effect from the date of receipt of the
order of such annulment by the ®[Principal
Commissioner or] Commissioner:

Provided that such revival shall cease to have effect, if
such order of annulment is set aside.]

Explanation.—For the removal of doubts, it is hereby
declared that,—

0] save as otherwise provided in this section, section
153B and section 153C, all other provisions of this Act
shall apply to the assessment made under this section;

(i) in an assessment or reassessment made in
respect of an assessment year under this section, the tax
shall be chargeable at the rate or rates as applicable to
such assessment year.




®ITime limit for completion of assessment under
section 153A.

®5 153B. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in section
153, the Assessing Officer shall make an order of
assessment or reassessment,—

@) in respect of each assessment year falling within six
assessment years ®°[and for the relevant assessment year
or years] referred to in clause (b) of sub-section (1) of
section 153A, within a period of twenty-one months from
the end of the financial year in which the last of the
authorisations for search under section 132 or for
requisition under 132A section 132A was executed,

(b) in respect of the assessment year relevant to the
previous year in which search is conducted under section
132 or requisition is made under section 132A, within a
period of twenty-one months from the end of the financial
year in which the last of the authorisations for search under
section 132 or for requisition under section 132A was
executed:

Provided that in case of other person referred to in section
153C, the period of limitation for making the assessment or
reassessment shall be the period as referred to in clause
(a) or clause (b) of this sub-section or nine months from the
end of the financial year in which books of account or
documents or assets seized or requisitioned are handed
over under section 153C to the Assessing Officer having
jurisdiction over such other person, whichever is later:

®[Time limit for completion of assessment under
section 153A.

7 153B. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in
section 153, the Assessing Officer shall make an order of
assessment or reassessment,—

(@) in respect of each assessment year falling within
six assessment years ®®[and for the relevant assessment
year or years] referred to in clause (b) of sub-section (1)
of section 153A, within a period of twenty-one months
from the end of the financial year in which the last of the
authorisations for search under section 132 or for
requisition under section 132A was executed,;

(b) in respect of the assessment year relevant to the
previous year in which search is conducted under section
132 or requisition is made under section 132A, within a
period of twenty-one months from the end of the financial
year in which the last of the authorisations for search
under section 132 or for requisition under section 132A
was executed:

Provided that in case of other person referred to in
section 153C, the period of limitation for making the
assessment or reassessment shall be the period as
referred to in clause (a) or clause (b) of this sub-section
or nine months from the end of the financial year in which
books of account or documents or assets seized or
requisitioned are handed over under section 153C to the
Assessing Officer having jurisdiction over such other




®/[Provided further that in the case where the last of the
authorisations for search wunder section 132 or for
requisition under section 132A was executed during the
financial year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2018,—

0] the provisions of clause (a) or clause (b) of this sub-
section shall have effect, as if for the words "twenty-one
months", the words "eighteen months" had been
substituted;

(i) the period of limitation for making the assessment or
reassessment in case of other person referred to in section
153C, shall be the period of eighteen months from the end
of the financial year in which the last of the authorisations
for search under section 132 or for requisition under section
132A was executed or twelve months from the end of the
financial year in which books of account or documents or
assets seized or requisitioned are handed over under
section 153C to the Assessing Officer having jurisdiction
over such other person, whichever is later:

Provided also that in the case where the last of the
authorisations for search under section 132 or for
requisition under section 132A was executed during the
financial year commencing on or after the 1st day of April,
2019,—

0] the provisions of clause (a) or clause (b) of this sub-
section shall have effect, as if for the words "twenty-one
months", the words "twelve months" had been substituted;

(i) the period of limitation for making the assessment or

person, whichever is later:

®[Provided further that in the case where the last of the
authorisations for search under section 132 or for
requisition under section 132A was executed during the
financial year commencing on the 1st day of April,
2018,—

0] the provisions of clause (a) or clause (b) of this
sub-section shall have effect, as if for the words "twenty-
one months", the words "eighteen months" had been
substituted;

(i) the period of limitation for making the assessment
or reassessment in case of other person referred to in
section 153C, shall be the period of eighteen months
from the end of the financial year in which the last of the
authorisations for search under section 132 or for
requisition under section 132A was executed or twelve
months from the end of the financial year in which books
of account or documents or assets seized or requisitioned
are handed over under section 153C to the Assessing
Officer having jurisdiction over such other person,
whichever is later:

Provided also that in the case where the last of the
authorisations for search under section 132 or for
requisition under section 132A was executed during the
financial year commencing on or after the 1st day of April,
2019,—

0] the provisions of clause (a) or clause (b) of this




reassessment in case of other person referred to in section
153C, shall be the period of twelve months from the end of
the financial year in which the last of the authorisations for
search under section 132 or for requisition under section
132A was executed or twelve months from the end of the
financial year in which books of account or documents or
assets seized or requisitioned are handed over under
section 153C to the Assessing Officer having jurisdiction
over such other person, whichever is later:

Provided also that in case where the last of the
authorisations for search under section 132 or for
requisition under section 132A was executed and during the
course of the proceedings for the assessment or
reassessment of total income, a reference under sub-
section (1) of section 92CA is made, the period available for
making an order of assessment or reassessment shall be
extended by twelve months:

Provided also that in case where during the course of the
proceedings for the assessment or reassessment of total
income in case of other person referred to in section 153C,
a reference under sub-section (1) of section 92CA is made,
the period available for making an order of assessment or
reassessment in case of such other person shall be
extended by twelve months.]

(2) The authorisation referred to in clause (a) and clause (b)
of sub-section (1) shall be deemed to have been
executed,—

@) in the case of search, on the conclusion of search as

sub-section shall have effect, as if for the words "twenty-
one months", the words "twelve months" had been
substituted;

(i) the period of limitation for making the assessment
or reassessment in case of other person referred to in
section 153C, shall be the period of twelve months from
the end of the financial year in which the last of the
authorisations for search under section 132 or for
requisition under section 132A was executed or twelve
months from the end of the financial year in which books
of account or documents or assets seized or requisitioned
are handed over under section 153C to the Assessing
Officer having jurisdiction over such other person,
whichever is later:

Provided also that in case where the last of the
authorisations for search under section 132 or for
requisition under section 132A was executed and during
the course of the proceedings for the assessment or
reassessment of total income, a reference under sub-
section (1) of section 92CA is made, the period available
for making an order of assessment or reassessment shall
be extended by twelve months:

Provided also that in case where during the course of
the proceedings for the assessment or reassessment of
total income in case of other person referred to in section
153C, a reference under sub-section (1) of section 92CA
is made, the period available for making an order of




recorded in the last panchnama drawn in relation to any
person in whose case the warrant of authorisation has been
issued; or

(b) in the case of requisition under section 132A, on the
actual receipt of the books of account or other documents
or assets by the Authorised Officer.

(3) The provisions of this section, as they stood immediately
before the commencement of the Finance Act, 2016, shall
apply to and in relation to any order of assessment or
reassessment made before the 1st day of June, 2016:

®8[Provided that where a notice under section 153A or
section 153C has been issued prior to the 1st day of June,
2016 and the assessment has not been completed by such
date due to exclusion of time referred to in the Explanation,
such assessment shall be completed in accordance with
the provisions of this section as it stood immediately before
its substitution by the Finance Act, 2016 (28 of 2016).]

Explanation.—In computing the period of limitation under
this section—

0] the period during which the assessment proceeding
is stayed by an order or injunction of any court; or

(i) the period commencing from the date on which the
Assessing Officer directs the assessee to get his accounts
audited under sub-section (2A) of section 142 and—

(@) ending with the last date on which the assessee is
required to furnish a report of such audit under that sub-

assessment or reassessment in case of such other
person shall be extended by twelve months.]

(2) The authorisation referred to in clause (a) and clause
(b) of sub-section (1) shall be deemed to have been
executed,—

(@) in the case of search, on the conclusion of search
as recorded in the last panchnama drawn in relation to
any person in whose case the warrant of authorisation
has been issued; or

(b) in the case of requisition under section 132A, on
the actual receipt of the books of account or other
documents or assets by the Authorised Officer.

(3) The provisions of this section, as they stood
immediately before the commencement of the Finance
Act, 2016, shall apply to and in relation to any order of
assessment or reassessment made before the 1st day of
June, 2016:

IProvided that where a notice under section 153A or
section 153C has been issued prior to the 1st day of
June, 2016 and the assessment has not been completed
by such date due to exclusion of time referred to in the
Explanation, such assessment shall be completed in
accordance with the provisions of this section as it stood
immediately before its substitution by the Finance Act,
2016 (28 of 2016).]

Explanation.—In computing the period of limitation under
this section—




section; or

(b) where such direction is challenged before a court,
ending with the date on which the order setting aside such
direction is received by the Principal Commissioner or
Commissioner; or

(i) the period commencing from the date on which the
Assessing Officer makes a reference to the Valuation
Officer under sub-section (1) of section 142A and ending
with the date on which the report of the Valuation Officer is
received by the Assessing Officer; or

(iv) the time taken in re-opening the whole or any part
of the proceeding or in giving an opportunity to the
assessee of being re-heard under the proviso to section
129; or

(v) in a case where an application made before the
Income-tax Settlement Commission is rejected by it or is
not allowed to be proceeded with by it, the period
commencing from the date on which an application is made
before the Settlement Commission under section 245C and
ending with the date on which the order under sub-section
(1) of section 245D is received by the Principal
Commissioner or Commissioner under sub-section (2) of
that section; or

(vi) the period commencing from the date on which an
application is made before the Authority for Advance
Rulings under sub- section (1) of section 245Q and ending

(1) the period during which the assessment
proceeding is stayed by an order or injunction of any
court; or

(i) the period commencing from the date on which
the Assessing Officer directs the assessee to get his
accounts audited under sub-section (2A) of section 142
and—

(@) ending with the last date on which the assessee
is required to furnish a report of such audit under that
sub-section; or

(b) where such direction is challenged before a court,
ending with the date on which the order setting aside
such direction is received by the Principal Commissioner
or Commissioner; or

(i) the period commencing from the date on which
the Assessing Officer makes a reference to the Valuation
Officer under sub-section (1) of section 142A and ending
with the date on which the report of the Valuation Officer
is received by the Assessing Officer; or

(iv) the time taken in re-opening the whole or any part
of the proceeding or in giving an opportunity to the
assessee of being re-heard under the proviso to section
129; or

(v) in a case where an application made before the
Income-tax Settlement Commission is rejected by it or is




with the date on which the order rejecting the application is
received by the Principal Commissioner or Commissioner
under sub-section (3) of section 245R; or

(vii) the period commencing from the date on which an
application is made before the Authority for Advance
Rulings under sub- section (1) of section 245Q and ending
with the date on which the advance ruling pronounced by it
is received by the Principal Commissioner or Commissioner
under sub-section (7) of section 245R; or

(viii)  the period commencing from the date of annulment
of a proceeding or order of assessment or reassessment
referred to in sub-section (2) of section 153A, till the date of
the receipt of the order setting aside the order of such
annulment, by the Principal Commissioner or
Commissioner; or

(iX) the period commencing from the date on which a
reference or first of the references for exchange of
information is made by an authority competent under an
agreement referred to in section 90 or section 90A and
ending with the date on which the information requested is
last received by the Principal Commissioner or
Commissioner or a period of one year, whichever is less; or

(x) the period commencing from the date on which a
reference for declaration of an arrangement to be an
impermissible avoidance arrangement is received by the
Principal Commissioner or Commissioner under sub-

not allowed to be proceeded with by it, the period
commencing from the date on which an application is
made before the Settlement Commission under section
245C and ending with the date on which the order under
sub-section (1) of section 245D is received by the
Principal Commissioner or Commissioner under sub-
section (2) of that section; or

(vi) the period commencing from the date on which
an application is made before the Authority for Advance
Rulings "*[or before the Board for Advance Rulings]
under sub-section (1) of section 245Q and ending with
the date on which the order rejecting the application is
received by the Principal Commissioner or Commissioner
under sub-section (3) of section 245R; or

(vii) the period commencing from the date on which
an application is made before the Authority for Advance
Rulings "*[or before the Board for Advance Rulings]
under sub-section (1) of section 245Q and ending with
the date on which the advance ruling pronounced by it is
received by the Principal Commissioner or Commissioner
under sub-section (7) of section 245R; or

(viii)  the period commencing from the date of
annulment of a proceeding or order of assessment or
reassessment referred to in sub-section (2) of section
153A, till the date of the receipt of the order setting aside
the order of such annulment, by the Principal




section (1) of section 144BA and ending on the date on
which a direction under sub-section (3) or sub-section (6) or
an order under sub-section (5) of the said section is
received by the Assessing Officer,

shall be excluded:

Provided that where immediately after the exclusion of the
aforesaid period, the period of limitation referred to in
clause (a) or clause (b) of this sub-section available to the
Assessing Officer for making an order of assessment or
reassessment, as the case may be, is less than sixty days,
such remaining period shall be extended to sixty days and
the aforesaid period of limitation shall be deemed to be
extended accordingly:

Provided further that where the period available to the
Transfer Pricing Officer is extended to sixty days in
accordance with the proviso to sub-section (3A) of section
92CA and the period of limitation available to the Assessing
Officer for making an order of assessment or
reassessment, as the case may be, is less than sixty days,
such remaining period shall be extended to sixty days and
the aforesaid period of limitation shall be deemed to be
extended accordingly:]

®[Provided also that where a proceeding before the
Settlement Commission abates under section 245HA, the
period of limitation available under this section to the
Assessing Officer for making an order of assessment or
reassessment, as the case may be, shall, after the
exclusion of the period under sub-section (4) of section

Commissioner or Commissioner; or

(ix) the period commencing from the date on which a
reference or first of the references for exchange of
information is made by an authority competent under an
agreement referred to in section 90 or section 90A and
ending with the date on which the information requested
is last received by the Principal Commissioner or
Commissioner or a period of one year, whichever is less;
or

(x) the period commencing from the date on which a
reference for declaration of an arrangement to be an
impermissible avoidance arrangement is received by the
Principal Commissioner or Commissioner under sub-
section (1) of section 144BA and ending on the date on
which a direction under sub-section (3) or sub-section (6)
or an order under sub-section (5) of the said section is
received by the Assessing Officer,

shall be excluded:

Provided that where immediately after the exclusion of
the aforesaid period, the period of limitation referred to in
clause (a) or clause (b) of this sub-section available to the
Assessing Officer for making an order of assessment or
reassessment, as the case may be, is less than sixty
days, such remaining period shall be extended to sixty
days and the aforesaid period of limitation shall be
deemed to be extended accordingly:

Provided further that where the period available to the




245HA, be not less than one year; and where such period
of limitation is less than one year, it shall be deemed to
have been extended to one year.]

Transfer Pricing Officer is extended to sixty days in
accordance with the proviso to sub-section (3A) of
section 92CA and the period of limitation available to the
Assessing Officer for making an order of assessment or
reassessment, as the case may be, is less than sixty
days, such remaining period shall be extended to sixty
days and the aforesaid period of limitation shall be
deemed to be extended accordingly:]

Provided also that where a proceeding before the
Settlement Commission abates under section 245HA, the
period of limitation available under this section to the
Assessing Officer for making an order of assessment or
reassessment, as the case may be, shall, after the
exclusion of the period under sub-section (4) of section
245HA, be not less than one year; and where such period
of limitation is less than one year, it shall be deemed to
have been extended to one year:]

2 [Provided also that where the assessee exercises the
option to withdraw the application under sub-section (1)
of section 245M, the period of limitation available under
this section to the Assessing Officer for making an order
of assessment or reassessment, as the case may be,
shall, after the exclusion of the period under sub-section
(5) of the said section, be not less than one year; and
where such period of limitation is less than one year, it
shall be deemed to have been extended to one year. |




Assessment of income of any other person. *°

1 153C. "[(1)] "*[Notwithstanding anything contained in
section 139, section 147, section 148, section 149, section
151 and section 153, where the Assessing Officer is
satisfied that,—

@) any money, bullion, jewellery or other valuable
article or thing, seized or requisitioned, "“belongs to; or

(b) any books of account or documents, seized or
requisitioned, pertains or pertain to, or any information
contained therein, relates to,

a person other than the person referred to in section 153A,
then, the books of account or documents or assets, seized
or requisitioned shall be handed over to the Assessing
Officer having jurisdiction over such other person] "’[and
that Assessing Officer shall proceed against each such
other person and issue notice and assess or reassess the
income of the other person in accordance with the
provisions of section 153A, if, that Assessing Officer is
satisfied that the books of account or documents or assets
seized or requisitioned have a bearing on the determination
of the total income of such other person “°[for six
assessment years immediately preceding the assessment
year relevant to the previous year in which search is
conducted or requisition is made and] for the relevant
assessment year or years referred to in sub-section (1) of
section 153A] :]

""IProvided that in case of such other person, the reference

Assessment of income of any other person. '*

3 153C. ™[(1)] "[Notwithstanding anything contained in
section 139, section 147, section 148, section 149,
section 151 and section 153, where the Assessing Officer
is satisfied that,—

@) any money, bullion, jewellery or other valuable
article or thing, seized or requisitioned, "°belongs to; or

(b) any books of account or documents, seized or
requisitioned, pertains or pertain to, or any information
contained therein, relates to,

a person other than the person referred to in section
153A, then, the books of account or documents or assets,
seized or requisitioned shall be handed over to the
Assessing Officer having jurisdiction over such other
person] ‘‘[and that Assessing Officer shall proceed
against each such other person and issue notice and
assess or reassess the income of the other person in
accordance with the provisions of section 153A, if, that
Assessing Officer is satisfied that the books of account or
documents or assets seized or requisitioned have a
bearing on the determination of the total income of such
other person "®[for six assessment years immediately
preceding the assessment year relevant to the previous
year in which search is conducted or requisition is made
and] for the relevant assessment year or years referred to




to the date of initiation of the search under section 132 or
making of requisition under section 132A in the second
proviso to ®[sub-section (1) of] section 153A shall be
construed as reference to the date of receiving the books of
account or documents or assets seized or requisitioned by
the Assessing Officer having jurisdiction over such other
person :]

[Provided further that the Central Government may by
rules®® made by it and published in the Official Gazette,
specify the class or classes of cases in respect of such
other person, in which the Assessing Officer shall not be
required to issue notice for assessing or reassessing the
total income for six assessment years immediately
preceding the assessment year relevant to the previous
year in which search is conducted or requisition is made
81[and for the relevant assessment year or years as referred
to in sub-section (1) of section 153A] except in cases where
any assessment or reassessment has abated.]

8[(2) Where books of account or documents or assets
seized or requisitioned as referred to in sub-section (1) has
or have been received by the Assessing Officer having
jurisdiction over such other person after the due date for
furnishing the return of income for the assessment year
relevant to the previous year in which search is conducted
under section 132 or requisition is made under section
132A and in respect of such assessment year—

@) no return of income has been furnished by such
other person and no notice under sub-section (1) of section

in sub-section (1) of section 153A] ]

IProvided that in case of such other person, the
reference to the date of initiation of the search under
section 132 or making of requisition under section 132A
in the second proviso to ®[sub-section (1) of] section
153A shall be construed as reference to the date of
receiving the books of account or documents or assets
seized or requisitioned by the Assessing Officer having
jurisdiction over such other person ]

8Provided further that the Central Government may by
rules®* made by it and published in the Official Gazette,
specify the class or classes of cases in respect of such
other person, in which the Assessing Officer shall not be
required to issue notice for assessing or reassessing the
total income for six assessment years immediately
preceding the assessment year relevant to the previous
year in which search is conducted or requisition is made
8land for the relevant assessment year or years as
referred to in sub-section (1) of section 153A] except in
cases where any assessment or reassessment has
abated.]

8[(2) Where books of account or documents or assets
seized or requisitioned as referred to in sub-section (1)
has or have been received by the Assessing Officer
having jurisdiction over such other person after the due
date for furnishing the return of income for the
assessment year relevant to the previous year in which
search is conducted under section 132 or requisition is




142 has been issued to him, or

(b) a return of income has been furnished by such other
person but no notice under sub-section (2) of section 143
has been served and limitation of serving the notice under
sub-section (2) of section 143 has expired, or

(© assessment or reassessment, if any, has been
made,

before the date of receiving the books of account or
documents or assets seized or requisitioned by the
Assessing Officer having jurisdiction over such other
person, such Assessing Officer shall issue the notice and
assess or reassess total income of such other person of
such assessment year in the manner provided in section
153A.]

made under section 132A and in respect of such
assessment year—

(@) no return of income has been furnished by such
other person and no notice under sub-section (1) of
section 142 has been issued to him, or

(b) a return of income has been furnished by such
other person but no notice under sub-section (2) of
section 143 has been served and limitation of serving the
notice under sub-section (2) of section 143 has expired,
or

(© assessment or reassessment, if any, has been
made,

before the date of receiving the books of account or
documents or assets seized or requisitioned by the
Assessing Officer having jurisdiction over such other
person, such Assessing Officer shall issue the notice and
assess or reassess total income of such other person of
such assessment year in the manner provided in section

153A.]

84a 1 (3) Nothing contained in this section shall apply in

relation to a search initiated under section 132 or books
of account, other documents or any assets requisitioned
under section 132A on or after the 1st day of April, 2021.

]







